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On

October 5, 2009, Radio
Green Earth wi l l  be
welcoming Madeline
Kaplan, author of Planet
Earth Gets Well , to discuss
her book and her inspiration.
Planet Earth Gets Well  is a
pic ture book that teaches
chi ldren about protec ting
their environment with a
memorable story about
Planet Earth getting the
“sniffles.” Holding a B. A. in
Literature and an MBA, Ms
Kaplan has previously
written many artic les on
business but c redits her three
grandchildren with the
inspiration to write Planet
Earth Gets Well .

Radio Green Earth wil l  also
be welcoming Dr. Bradley J.
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Dr. Bradford

Bradford, M.D.,

F.A.A.P, to talk about the
novel H1N1 virus that has
put the world on alert and
how to best protec t your
family & environment. Dr.
Bradford is president and
founder of Pediatrics by the

Sea

[http://www.pediatricsbythesea.com]
and past president of the
Pennsylvania Chapter of the
American Academy of
Pediatrics. He is also the
founding member of the
American Academy of
Pediatrics’ Sec tion on
School Health.
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